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Remembrance Day 2019 

On Monday 11 November, Ms Craven had the pleasure 
of taking our student leaders to Victoria Park, St Marys 
for the 2019 Remembrance Day Service.  

Our leaders respectfully represented our school 
community during this ceremony, laying a wreath 
honouring our servicemen and women. 

"When we arrived we listened to some people speak and 
there were soldiers there. The memorial was built 97 
years ago and still to this day, it is a place to hold 
Remembrance Day services. All four of us laid a wreath 
at the bottom of the stairs to pay our respect.  

At the end of the memorial the flag was raised and 
students from Erskine Park High School played the 
National Anthem.  

Some of the things we took from this experience 
was learning about the area's loss during the war and 
about the fallen soldiers in 1918.  

Thank you Ms Craven and Ms Cooper for letting us have 
this wonderful experience."  

(A reflection from our school leaders) 

 

 

 
School Captains and Vice Captains with Ms Cooper 
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 Regional Athletics Carnival  
  

On Thursday 17th October, the following students 
attended the Sydney West Regional Athletics Carnival, 
representing the St Marys zone. All students participated 
to the best of their ability and represented Colyton Public 
School with pride. 
  
Tristan 6J  12yr boys 800m 

                   12yr boys 1500m 
 
Ali 6R  13yr boys 100m 

               Senior boys long jump  
 
Young 6A 11yr boys high jump 

 
Jayden 6A 11yr boys discus 

 
Jamaal 5K 11yr boys high jump 
 
Brayden 4/5B Junior boys 800m 

                          Junior boys 1500m 
 
Aiden 3P Junior boys long jump 

 
Marian 3D Junior girls discus 

  
Congratulations to all on a fine effort!  
 
A special thank you goes to the families who were able 
to transport other students to the event. 
 

 
Ali T from 6R represents at the  
State Level  
 
Congratulations goes to Ali Taqizada from 6R, who 

participated at the State Athletics Championships. Ali 
placed an impressive 11th in New South Wales in the 
100m. Congratulations Ali, we are extremely proud of 
you! 
  
Sarah King                                                                                       
Classroom Teacher Year 5 

 
Is your child not returning to 

Colyton Public School in 2020? 

It is important for us to have accurate numbers of 

returning students when assigning classes for the year.  

If your child is NOT returning to Colyton Public 

School in 2020 please inform your child’s class teacher 

or the office staff as soon as possible.  

Please phone the office on 9625-8185 if you have any 

questions. 

NSW Dance Sport Ballroom 
Dance competition 
 

On Tuesday 22nd October 2019 the Senior and Junior 
Ballroom Dance teams competed at the NSW Dance 
Sport Championships accompanied by Miss Villa-Real, 
Mrs Sabellico and Mr Wilkinson.  
 
All the students gave their best effort and represented 
Colyton Public School with pride. A big Congratulations 
to Georgia Borg and Marlo Lardizabal for placing 2nd out 
of 16 schools in the Cha Cha.  

 

 
 

 
 
Joyce Villa-Real  
K-2 EAL/D Teacher 
 
 
 

State Spelling Bee 

Last Friday, 8 November I had the privilege of attending 

the State Spelling Bee with Yash Singla and his family. 

It was held at the Eugene Goossens Hall ABC, Ultimo. 

The Senior Finals were held first, commencing at 

9:30am and expected to be completed by 12:30pm. 

However, the 49 Regional Representatives were such 

amazing spellers that the competition concluded over 

an hour overtime! Our announcer was the very 

entertaining Wendy Harmer and we had a special visit 

from our Premier, Gladys Berejiklian who had taken 

time out of her busy schedule visiting our bushfire 

zones. 



 

 
 

Yash completed up to Level 6 when only 18 out of the 

49 were left. He was a confident and accurate 

competitor who represented us with pride. Yash had 

memorised all the known words from the lists available. 

A wonderful achievement! 

He left very happy with a bag full of goodies, including a 

medal, certificate, headphones, a novel and of course a 

Macquarie Dictionary.  

Well done Yash we are so proud of your outstanding 

achievements. 

 

 

 

Mrs Rodgers                                                                                 
OC Classroom Teacher 

 

 

Application for Extended Leave 

–What you need to do 

If you intend to take your child on an extended holiday 

in or out of Australia you will need to make an 

‘Application for Extended Leave’ (pictured below) 

BEFORE you departure. These forms are available 

from the front office. Once completed they should be 

returned to school for Principal Endorsement. 

Please note that if your travel is overseas you MUST also 
provide a copy of your flight itinerary with your application 
form. 

 

 

Term 4 - 2019 
 

Week 5 

SWIM SCHOOL ALL WEEK - 9am-11:15am 
 
Thursday 14th November  Colyton Cubs Playgroup 9am – 11am 

- Kindergarten Orientation Day 1 

 
Friday 15th November   Play and Stay @ Colyton Playgroup 9am-11am 
 

Week 6 

SWIM SCHOOL ALL WEEK - 9am-11:15am 
 
Thursday 21st November  Colyton Cubs Playgroup 9am – 11am 

- Kindergarten Orientation Day 2 

 
Friday 22nd November   Play and Stay @ Colyton Playgroup 9am-11am 

 



 

 

 
 

Week 7 

   
Thursday 28th November  Colyton Cubs Playgroup 9am – 11am 

- Kindergarten Orientation Day 3 

 
Friday 29th November   Play and Stay @ Colyton Playgroup 9am-11am 
 

Week 8 
 
Wednesday 4th December  Recognition Assembly 
 
Thursday 5th December   Colyton Cubs Playgroup 9am – 11am 

- Kindergarten Orientation Day 4 

 
Friday 6th December   Play and Stay @ Colyton Playgroup 9am-11am 
 

Week 9 

   
Monday 9th December   Year 6 Farewell 
 
Wednesday 11th December  Presentation Night from 6:30pm 

Friday 13th December   K-5 Celebration Concert                                                                                 

- Year 6 LUNA PARK                                                                           

- Class Party Day  

 

Week 10 
 

Monday 16th December   Year 6 Graduation Ceremony 

 

Wednesday 18th December  Last day of Term 4 for students 

 

Thursday 19th December  Staff Development Day – NO STUDENTS 

 

Friday 20th December   Staff Development Day – NO STUDENTS 

 

 



 

 

 
 

 



 

 

 
 

 



 

 

 
 

 



 

 

 
 

 

 
 



 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 


